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How to Add an Attorney  

to an Existing Case 

Pennsylvania’s Unified Judicial System Web Portal 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

2. Access the 
Search Attorney 
screen 

In the Attorneys tab of 
the GTS Case screen, 
click the Attorney 
Search icon above the 
Attorneys grid. 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 
 

4. Click SEARCH 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

1. Search for the 
case 

On your Dashboard, 
click in the Case File 
No field, enter the 
number for the case, 
and press [Enter] on 
your keyboard. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
3. Enter the 

attorney’s name 
Enter the attorney’s 
Last Name and First 
Name. 
 

 If known, using the 
attorney’s PA Bar 
Number is the quickest 
way to find their record. 

 

 
5. Choose the 

attorney 
Click the radio button 
that appears to the left 
of the attorney and 
click the SELECT 
button. 
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5. Select the 
represented 
party 

In the Add/Edit 
Attorney Details popup, 
click the Representing 
dropdown and select 
the appropriate 
participant. 

 

 

 

 

7. Click SAVE 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

6. (Optional) 
Record the 
appointment 
details 

Complete one or more 
of the following: 
 
• If the attorney was 
appointed by the court 
to represent a party on 
the case, click the 
Appointed By Court 
checkbox and record 
the Appointment 
Date. 
 
• Select the Paid by 
County checkbox if the 
attorney receives 
payment from the 
county for their legal 
services. 

 

 


